BID TABULATION FORM

Bid: 25/26-066

Storm Damage Berm Repairs at Clay
Proj: County Outdoor Adventure Park
Ad: Clay Today, May 7, 2026

This is a generic Bid Tabulation Form; all required bid documents will be verified prior to bid recommendation.

Date:

Time Open:
Time Close:

June 12, 2026

9:00 AM

Bids to be based on ion criteria it in bid
Bidder Addendum Bid Bond Base Bid Total Alternate #1 Total Alternate #2 Total Alternate #3 Total Alternate #4 Total Alternate #5 Total Alternate #6 Total Total

2K All Services Yes Yes $39,890.88 $15,533.32 $5,328.40 $4.542.80 $4.404.60 $11,445.00 $4,150.00 $85,295.00
1

Advanced Project Solutions, LLC Yes Yes $109,360.00 $55,007.00 $10,726.00 $10,660.00 $35,568.00 $49,136.00 $6,529.00 $276,986.00
2

CGC, Inc. NO BID
3

G&W Site Services LLC Yes CC49017 $84,272.40 $41,706.80 $8,788.40 $8,331.20 $914.40 $13,866.80 $2,000.00 $159,880.00
4

H&H Land and Marine, LLC Yes CC6657705793 $104,976.00 $47,618.00 $10,034.00 $9,512.00 $1,044.00 $17,000.00 $6,000.00 $196,184.00
5

MURRAY FORD OF STARKE NO BID
6




RFP

Proj:
Ad:

BID TABULATION FORM

25/26-085

Public Private Partnership (P3) to Design, Build and
Finance a Public Safety Complex in Clay County

Clay Today, April 16,2026

Date:

Time Open:

Time Close:

June 16, 2026

9:01 AM
9:03 AM

This is a generic Bid Tabulation Form; all required bid documents will be verified prior to bid recommendation.

Bids to be evaluated based on evaluation criteria established in bid document

Bidder Addendum Total
1|Balfour Beatty Developments, Inc. Yes To Be Determined
2|E2L Real Estate Solutions, LLC Yes To Be Determined
3|Florida Development Solutions, LLC Yes To Be Determined
4/HDR Architecture, Inc. No Bid
5|Murray Ford of Starke No Bid
6|VanTrust Real Estate, LLC dba VTRE Development, LLC Yes To Be Determined
7
8
9

10
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