BID RECOMMENDATION FORM

TITLE: DATE OF RECOMMENDATION:
RFB No. 25/26-087 EMS Medical Supplies 6/5/2026

BIDDER BID TOTAL

Bound Tree Medical, LLC To Be Determined

Drake Pharmacy Solutions, LLC To Be Determined

Hamilton Medical, Inc To Be Determined

Henry Schein, Inc To Be Determined
Life-Assist Inc To Be Determined
McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions, LLC To Be Determined
MEQU Warmer Systems Corporation To Be Determined
Revelation Wholesale, LLC To Be Determined
Stryker Sales, LLC through its Medical Division To Be Determined
Technicuff Corp. To Be Determined
Traffic Protection Solutions No-Bid
FUNDING SOURCE: Fire Control MSTU Fund - Fire Control MSTU - Operating Supplies

General Fund - Rescue Services - Operating Supplies
RECOMMENDATION:

Approval to post Notice of Intent to Award Bid No. 25/26-087, EMS Medical Supplies, as a multiple-award contract to
ten (10) responsive and responsible bidders: Bound Tree Medical, LLC; Drake Pharmacy Solutions LLC; Hamilton
Medical, Inc.; Henry Schein, Inc.; Life-Assist, Inc.; McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC; MEQU
Warmer Systems Corporation; Revelation Wholesale LLC; Stryker Sales, LLC through its Medical Division; and
Technicuff Corp. Approval of award will be effective after the 72-hour protest period has expired.

If only one Bid is received, state reason why accepted and not rebidding:

Staff Assigned to Tabulate Bids and Make Recommendations:
NAME/TITLE: SIGNATURE:

Dudley Lee/Logistics Section Bureau Chief Duﬁeaeewun 18,2026 14:11:34 EDT)




BID TABULATION FORM

RFB: 25/26-087

Proj:

Ad:

EMS Medical Supplies
Clay Today, May 7, 2026

Date: June 2, 2026
Time Open: 9:03 AM
Time Close: 9:08 AM

This is a generic Bid Tabulation Form; all required bid documents will be verified prior to bid recommendation.

Bids to be evaluated based on evaluation criteria established in bid document

Bidder Addendum Total
1 |Bound Tree Medical, LLC Yes To Be Determined
2 |Drake Pharmacy Solutions, LLC Yes To Be Determined
3 |Hamilton Medical, Inc. Yes To Be Determined
4 |Henry Schein, Inc. Yes To Be Determined
5 |Life-Assist, Inc. Yes To Be Determined
6 |MEQU Warmer Systems Corporation Yes To Be Determined
7 |McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions, LLC. Yes To Be Determined
8 |Revelation Wholesale, LLC Yes To Be Determined
9 |Stryker Sales, LLC through its medical Division Yes To Be Determined
10 |Technicuff Corp. Yes To Be Determined

11

Traffic Protection Solutions

No Bid




Bound Tree
Medical, LLC

Drake

Pharmacy
Solutions

X A100 handheld complete Ea No Bid No Bid S.87 $.96
X A101 Adult - Nebulizer Mask Ea S.77 No Bid No Bid S$1.12

X A102 Adult, non-flared 7' tubing Ea S.47 No Bid No Bid

X A103 Adult Ea $1.16 No Bid No Bid $1.13
X A104 7’ 02 Tubing (just tubing) Ea No Bid No Bid

X A105 Adult Ea No Bid No Bid $9.10 $9.42
X A105a Adult Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.59
X A106 Pediatric Ea S.80 No Bid No Bid S.71

X A107 Pediatric, non flared Ea No Bid No Bid S.56

X A108 pediatric Ea No Bid No Bid $1.38 $1.45
X A109 pediatric Ea No Bid No Bid S.95
X A110 pediatric Ea No Bid No Bid $10.65 $10.80
X Al110a pediatric Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.65
X Alll infant Ea No Bid No Bid

X A112 Infant Ea No Bid No Bid $1.65
X Al113 Infant Ea No Bid No Bid $10.65 $10.80
X Al13a infant Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.89
X Al114 2.0 Cuffed Only Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A115 2.5 Cuffed Only Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid

X A116 3.0 Cuffed Only Ea No Bid No Bid $1.99

X A117 3.5 Cuffed Only Ea No Bid No Bid $1.99 $2.95
X A118 4.0 Cuffed Only Ea No Bid No Bid $1.99

X A119 4.5 Cuffed Only Ea No Bid No Bid $1.99

X A120 5.0 Cuffed Only Ea No Bid No Bid

X Al121 5.5 Cuffed Only Ea No Bid No Bid $2.57
X A122 6.0 Cuffed Only Ea No Bid No Bid S2.57
X A123 6.5 Cuffed Only Ea No Bid No Bid S2.57
X A124 7.0 Cuffed Only Ea No Bid No Bid S2.57
X A125 7.5 Cuffed Only Ea No Bid No Bid $2.57
X A126 8.0 Cuffed Only Ea No Bid No Bid $2.57
X Al127 8.5 Cuffed Only Ea No Bid No Bid $2.57
X A128 9.0 Cuffed Only Ea No Bid No Bid S2.57
X A129 adult -Introducer Malleable Ea No Bid No Bid

X A130 pediatric - Introducer Ea No Bid No Bid

X Al134 adult w/room for Igel Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.85
X Al34a adult w/ room for Igel Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid

X A135 pediatric w/ room for Igel Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.29
X A135a pediatric w/ room for Igel Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

X A136 Mac #0 - Disposable Metal Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid S5.10

McKesson Stryker
Medical- MEQU Sales, LLC
Surgical Warmer through
Governmen | Systems |Revelation its
Technicuff
Corp.
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$1.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$2.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$2.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




X A137 Mac #1 -Disposable Metal Ea No Bid No Bid
X A138 Mac #2 - Disposable Metal Ea No Bid No Bid
X A139 Mac #3 - Disposable Metal Ea No Bid No Bid
X A140 Mac #4 - Disposable Metal Ea No Bid No Bid
Miller #0 - Disposable Metal
X Al141 blade Ea No Bid No Bid
Miller #1- Disposable Metal
X Al142 blade Ea No Bid No Bid
Miller #2 - Disposable Metal
X Al143 blade Ea No Bid No Bid
Miller #3 - Disposable Metal
X Al144 blade Ea No Bid No Bid
Miller #4 - Disposable Metal
X A145 blade Ea No Bid No Bid
X Al46 large Ea $5.40 No Bid No Bid
X A147 Pediatric Ea S5.40 No Bid No Bid
X A150 12 FR Ea No Bid No Bid
X A151 14 FR Ea No Bid No Bid
X A152 16 FR Ea No Bid No Bid
X A153 18 FR Ea No Bid No Bid
X Al154 20 FR Ea No Bid No Bid
X A155 22 FR Ea No Bid No Bid
X A156 24 FR Ea No Bid No Bid
X A157 26 FR Ea No Bid No Bid
X A158 28 FR Ea No Bid No Bid
X A159 30 FR Ea No Bid No Bid
X A160 OPA - 50mm - Infant/BLUE Ea No Bid No Bid
OPA - 60mm - Small
X Al61 Child/BLACK Ea No Bid No Bid
X A162 OPA - 70mm - Child/WHITE Ea No Bid No Bid
OPA - 80mm - Small
X A163 Adult/GREEN Ea No Bid No Bid
OPA - 90mm - Medium
X Al64 Adult/YELLOW Ea No Bid No Bid
X A165 OPA - 100mm - Large Ea No Bid No Bid
X A166 Adjustable from 0-20 cm H20 Ea $4.12 No Bid No Bid
Finger Probe - Non-disposable -
X A170 Stryker - 11996-000456 Ea $138.00 No Bid No Bid
Sp0O2 Adapter - Non-disposable
X A170-P - Stryker - 111996-000455 Ea $150.24 No Bid No Bid
X Al171 Rainbow Finger Probe - CO Ea _ No Bid No Bid
X Al173 SpO2 Disposable - Adult Ea $13.52 No Bid No Bid
X Al174 Sp02 Disposable - Pediatric Ea $13.52 No Bid No Bid
X A175 Sp02 Disposable - Infant Ea _ No Bid No Bid
X Al178 8 FR Ea $9.76 No Bid No Bid
X A179 12 FR Ea $2.73 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid $19.11 No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




X A180 14 FR Ea $2.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A181 16 FR Ea $2.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A183 Portable Ea 467.25x No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A184 6 FR - coil Pak Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A186 10 FR - coil pak Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A188 14 FR - coil pak Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A191 SSCOR DuCanto Catheter, Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X Al191a DuCanto w/ Tubing only Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A192 Compatible with DuCanto Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A194 1200cc Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A197 w/o syringe Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rainbow Adapter - Non-
X A198 disposable Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EtCO2 End Tidal Sampling
Filtered Line with Universal
X A202 Connector, 6ft Tubing Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A203 ETCO2 Capnography - Barrel Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A212 Adult, Smart Capnoline Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Go-PAP w/ Neb Cannister and
X A214 Neb-Connect Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Go-PAP w/ Neb Cannister and
X A215 Neb-Connect Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Go-PAP w/ Neb Cannister and
X A216 Neb-Connect Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A217 Aluminum 0-15LPM Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A219 Tranzport Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A220a IGEL - Size 1 Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A220b IGEL - Size 1.5 Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A220c IGEL - Size 2 Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A220d IGEL - Size 2.5 Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A221 IGEL - Size 3 Ea $25.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A221a IGEL - Size 3 Ea $25.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A221b IGEL - Size 4 Ea $25.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A221b -a IGEL - Size 4 Ea $25.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A221C IGEL - Size 5 Ea $25.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A221C-a IGEL - Size 5 Ea $25.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A222 GlideScope Go Camera Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A222a GlideScope Go Carrying Case Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A222b GlideScope Go Charger Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GlideScope Go Disposable
X A223 Blades - Miller SO0 Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GlideScope Go Disposable
X A224 Blades - Miller S2 Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GlideScope Go Disposable
X A225 Blades - MAC S1 Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




GlideScope Go Disposable

X A226 Blades - MAC S2 Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A228 Must have ET tube in kit Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LSU Suction Connector Hose
X A230 from container to pump Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A290 Digital Finger Pulse Oximeter Ea $16.97 No Bid No Bid $17.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A301 Hamilton Vent Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A302 Hamilton valved t adapter Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X A303 Hamilton Baterial/viral filter Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hamilton BiTrac - full face
X A304 mask - Large Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hamilton BiTrac - full face
X A305 mask - Medium Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hamilton BiTrac - full face
X A306 mask - Small Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hamilton Breathing circuit -
X A307 Adult/Ped Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hamilton BiTrac Max- full face
X A308 mask - Ped XSmall Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hamilton BiTrac Max- full face
X A309 mask - Ped XXSmall Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hamilton Breathing circuit -
X A310 Neonate Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X B101 Duracell Procell Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X B102 Duracell Procell Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X B103 Duracell Procell Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X B104 Duracell Procell Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X B105 Duracell Procell Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X B106 Portable LSU Battery Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X B110 Duracell Procell Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X B260 Lithium Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X D101 Adult Ea $7.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X D102 Child Ea $7.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X D103 Infant Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X D104 large adult Ea $8.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X D106 Adult-Littmann lightweight I Ea $52.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X D107 Pediatric, Proscope Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X D108 Infant, Proscope Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lg Adult-extender(extends 45-
X D109 55cm) Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.00
X D110 Adult (range 17-45cm) Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X D111 Child (range 9-25cm) Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X D112 Infant (range 5-15cm) Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X D113 Adult (25 pack) Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X D113a Adult Ea S.07 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X D114 All-purpose/50 pack Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid $37.80 No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid $100.80 No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
$.218 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$.06 NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
S.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.63 $.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

X D114a Pediatric/all purpose Ea S.41 No Bid No Bid
Adult- Edge System, Quick
X D115 Combo Pad Ea No Bid No Bid
X D115a Adult-Quick combo Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid
X D115b Adult-Quick combo Redi PAK Ea $38.67 No Bid No Bid
Pediatric, Edge Sys Quick
X D116 Combo Pad Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid
X D116a Pediatric-quick combo Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid
X D117 Infant/Child defibrillation Pads Ea No Bid No Bid
X D117a Infant/Child defibrillation Pads Ea No Bid No Bid
FREE MONITOR, CASE - W/
X D121 STRIPS PER BOTTLE Ea No Bid No Bid
FREE MONITOR, CASE - W/
X D121a STRIPS PER BOTTLE Ea No Bid No Bid
FREE MONITOR compatible w/
X D121b strips Ea No Bid No Bid
X D122 LP35 NIBP Hose (straight) Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid
X D127 21300-001365 Ea $140.70 No Bid No Bid
X G101 Non-sterile Ea S.02 No Bid No Bid
X G102 4" non-sterile Ea No Bid No Bid
X G103 6" non-sterile Ea No Bid No Bid
X G104 Sterile, individual Ea No Bid No Bid
X G105 4" sterile Ea S.28 No Bid No Bid
X G106 6" Sterile Ea S.41 No Bid No Bid
X G107 5" X 9" sterile Ea $.14 No Bid No Bid
X G108 60" X 90" sterile Ea No Bid No Bid
X G109 12" X 30" sterile Ea No Bid No Bid
X G110 MUST be latex free Ea No Bid No Bid
X G111 40" X40" X 56" Ea No Bid No Bid
X G112 3/4" X 3", cloth Ea No Bid No Bid
X G113 3" X 9" individual package Ea No Bid No Bid
large oval size individual
X G114 package Ea $.13 No Bid No Bid
X G116 Transpore Ea $1.13 No Bid No Bid
X G118 Transpore Ea No Bid No Bid
X G119 12" x 12" Ea No Bid No Bid
X G120 3" x 48" roll Ea $16.92 No Bid No Bid
X G121 3 x 48" Z-Fold Ea $35.06 No Bid No Bid
X G122 w/ valve Ea $18.13 No Bid No Bid
X G122a w/ valve Ea No Bid NoBid | NoBid |
X G123 paper Ea No Bid No Bid
4" Emergency high stregnth
X G124 pressue bandage - Touniquet Ea No Bid No Bid
6" Emergency high stregnth
X G125 pressue bandage - Touniquet Ea No Bid No Bid




Life Flow Plus - Rapid Blood

X IB100 Replacement Tubing Ea No Bid No Bid
Life Flow Plus - Rapid Blood
X IB101 and Fluid Infuser Ea No Bid No Bid
MicroFlex - Nitril Ultra Sence
X IC101 EC - Must be extended cuff Ea No Bid No Bid
X IC101a Nytrile Extended cuff Ea No Bid No Bid
MicroFlex - Nitril Ultra Sence
X IC102 EC - Must be extended cuff Ea No Bid No Bid
X IC102a Nytrile Extended cuff Ea No Bid No Bid
MicroFlex - Nitril Ultra Sence
X IC103 EC - Must be extended cuff Ea No Bid No Bid
X IC103a Nytrile Extended cuff Ea No Bid No Bid
MicroFlex - Nitril Ultra Sence
X IC104 EC - Must be extended cuff Ea No Bid No Bid
X IC104a Nytrile Extended cuff Ea No Bid No Bid
MicroFlex - Nitril Ultra Sence
X IC105 EC - Must be extended cuff Ea No Bid No Bid
X IC108 XL Tub Ea No Bid No Bid
X IC108a XL tub Ea No Bid No Bid
X IC109 16 oz bottle Ea No Bid No Bid
X IC110 16 oz bottle Ea No Bid No Bid
X IC111 Vomex Emesis Bag Ea No Bid No Bid
Comparable emesis bag to
X IC111a vomex Ea No Bid No Bid
X IC113 small - meets ANSI Z287.1 Ea No Bid No Bid
X IC116 1860 (regular) Ea No Bid No Bid
X IC117 1860S (small) Ea No Bid No Bid
X IC118 locking Ea $1.48 No Bid No Bid
X IC119 Model #184R Ea $15.70 No Bid No Bid
X IC120 Model #8509 Ea $4.84 No Bid No Bid
X IC122 roll Ea No Bid No Bid
X IC123 roll Ea No Bid No Bid
X IC124 roll Ea No Bid No Bid
X IC125 Flat top 8970 Ea No Bid No Bid
X IN136a windless style Ea No Bid No Bid
X V101 lcc Ea No Bid No Bid
X V102 3cc Ea No Bid No Bid
X V104 10cc Ea No Bid No Bid
X IV105 20cc Ea No Bid No Bid
X V108 60cc Ea No Bid No Bid
X IV109 18 gauge X 1.5" Ea No Bid No Bid
X V110 21 gauge X 1" Ea No Bid No Bid
X V111 23 gauge X 1.5" Ea No Bid No Bid
X V112 25 gauge X 1" Ea No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Blunt Filter Needle 1.5 in (5

X V113 micron) Ea No Bid No Bid S.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X IV116 45 mm BD-IO Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X IV116A Vender 45 mm alterinitive Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X V117 25 mm BO 10 Ea No Bid No Bid $138.85 NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
X IV117A Vender 25 mm alterinitive Ea No Bid No Bid $67.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X V118 15 mm BD 10 Ea No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
X IV118A Vender 15 mm alterinitive Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X IV118C 35mmBD IO Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X IV118C -A Vender 35 mm alterinitive Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
X IV118D 55 mm BD IO Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X IV118D -A Vender 55 mm alterinitive Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Curaplex BD IO Driver and
X IV119 charger Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X IV119A Vender alterinitive Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X IV1198B Curaplex BD IO Carrying Case | Ea No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
X IV119Ba Vender alterinitive Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X V120 15 ga (adult) Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X V121 18 ga (pediatric) Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X V122 large Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Introcan Safety IV Catheters w/
X IV123a Blood Control 14 gauge x 1.25" Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X IV123b 14 gauge safety x 1.25" Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Safety 10 gauge X 3.5"(pnumo
X IV123c decompression) Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Introcan Safety IV Catheters w/
X IV124a Blood Control 16 gauge x 1.25" Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X IV124b 16 gauge safety x 1.25" Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X IV125b 18 gauge safety 1.25" Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Introcan Safety 2 - w/ Blood
X IV126a Control - 20 gauge - x 1.25" Ea $1.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X IV126b 20 gauge safety 1.25" Ea |NSE48 | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
Introcan Safety 2 - w/ Blood
X IV127a Control - 22 gauge Ea $1.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X IV127a 22 gauge safety x 1.25" Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Introcan Safety 2 - w/ Blood
X IV128a Control - 24 gauge - x 1.25" Ea $1.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X IV128b 24 gauge safety x 1.25" Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
IV Administration Set, 10 Drop,
Non-vented, (1) Pre-Pierced Y-
Site, (1) Sure-Lok® Needle-Free
X V129 Y-Site, 83in Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
V Administration Set, 60 Drop,
Non-vented, (1) Pre-Pierced Y-
site, (1) Sure-Lok® Needle-Free
X V130 Y-site, 83in Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Extension Set/9" length

X V132 Standard/Macro Bore Ea $1.49 No Bid No Bid
X V133 Adult Ea No Bid No Bid
X IV133a adult Ea No Bid No Bid
X IV135 . Ea No Bid No Bid
X IV136 1" X 18" NO ROLLS Ea No Bid No Bid
X V137 retractable Ea No Bid No Bid
X V140 2N3395 Ea No Bid No Bid
115in Blood Set w/ 2 Non-
vented Spikes, 200 Filter,
X V141 Needleless Y-site, Ea S11.79 No Bid No Bid
Saphire Infusion pump -
Multitherapy- only - Internal
X V160 battery Ea No Bid No Bid $145.20
Saphire Infusion pump -
X V161 Multitherapy- only - PM Kit Ea $1,956.08 No Bid No Bid 114X
X V162 MEQU M Warmer (5 pc) Ea $3,440.00 No Bid No Bid 289X
MEQU M Warmer System -
X V163 Starter plus kit Ea $3,970.00 No Bid No Bid $7,050.00
Sapphire Multitherapy Infusion
X V164 Pump Ea No Bid No Bid
X IV165 Model - iBR105-GX Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid
X V166 For refridgerator # 220366 Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid
Blood warmer - Part Number -
NSN 6515-22-635-2850 -
Starter Kit Plus includes: (1)
Rechargeable Battery, (1)
X V167 Charger, and (5) Warmers Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid
Blood Warmer - Part Number
MWS201 - °M Warmer 5 pcs -
X V168 NSN 6515-22-631-5318 Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid
Introcan Safety 2 - 18 gauge w/
X IV25a blood control - x 1.25" Ea $1.90 No Bid No Bid
X MQ098 Temple Touch Thermometer Ea S11.16 No Bid No Bid
X MO099 Sure Temp 690 Ea No Bid No Bid
Sure Temp 690 Probe
X M100 Compatable Ea No Bid No Bid
Poly/Cotton average Size, clear
X M105 wrap Ea No Bid No Bid
X M106 60" X 90" Ea $2.60 No Bid No Bid
X M108 spring loaded Ea $8.77 No Bid No Bid
X M110 Ea $7.65 No Bid No Bid
X M111 Ea No Bid No Bid
X M112 . Ea No Bid No Bid
X M113 7 1/2" Heavy Duty Ea No Bid No Bid
X M114 disposable Ea No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




X M115 Adult, closed, 11" Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M116 Pediatric, closed, 8" Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M117 Aluminum, 9.5" x 5.75" Ea $26.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M118 Adult, 3" X 18" padded Ea $2.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M119 Pediatric, 3" X 9" padded Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M120 Infant, 2" X 6" padded Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M121 Soft, disposable limb restraints Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M122 Disposable 1000 ml Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M123 disposable/instant 6" X 9" Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M125 Sterile 3 grams Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M126 acetone free Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M127 0 - 25 LPM, Click Style - brass Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M128 . Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M129 #9661 Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M130 #9660 Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M131 #9662 Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M132 #9667 complete kit Ea $107.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M133 Ea $.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M135 8oz Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M150 Absorbent pads (Bag) Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Adhesive Bandages - Special
X M151 Needs Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M152 Baby Wipes Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M153 Body Wipes Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M154 Diapers - Medium Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M155 Diapers - XL Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M156 Dry Wipes Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M157 Patient Chuck Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M158 Maxi Pads Ea $.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M159 Tongue Depressor Ea S.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X M160 Urinal Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X o101 complete kit Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X 0102 1 oz individually wraped Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X 0103 . Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X 0104 Sterile Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X 0105 Sterile Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Naloxone HCI, 0.1mL, 4mg
X P100 Nasal Spray Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid
Naloxone HCI, 0.1mL, 4mg
X P100a Nasal Spray Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P101 6mg/2ml vial Ea No Bid | $3.78 | NoBid No Bid
X P102 2.5mg, 3mlvial Ea No Bid NoBid | NoBid
X P103 4mg/4ml, Vial Ea No Bid i No Bid No Bid
X P104 0.33cc each inhalation only Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P105 81mg Bottle Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P106 1mg, 10ml Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid




X P107 1gm, 10m Lifeshield Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NON-refrigerated 100mg Add
X P108 Vantage Vial Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P108a Refrigerated 25 mg/5mL Vial Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid S4.17 No Bid S4.50 No Bid No Bid
X P109 . Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P110 250ml bag Ea $2.90 No Bid No Bid $3.19 NoBid | NoBid
X P111 25gm, 50ml Ea $26.595 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P112 400mg, 250m! Ea | 51531 | NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid | No Bid
X P113 50mg/ml vial Ea $.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P114 1mg/10ml Ea $15.82 $15.999 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P115 40mg (10mg/ml) Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $1.45 | No Bid No Bid
X P118 3 per pack Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P120 2.5ml vial Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid S.29 No Bid S.28 No Bid No Bid
X P121 100mg, 20ml vial Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $6.15 | No Bid No Bid
X P122 100mg/ 5ml Ea No Bid No Bid $8.40 No Bid No Bid
X P123 1gm/2ml vials Ea No Bid No Bid $3.07 No Bid No Bid
X P124 2ml/2mg Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P124a 0.4mg/ml Vial Ea No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid
X P125 0.4mg Ea No Bid No Bid $.72 No Bid No Bid
X P126 25mg/ml vial Ea No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid
X P127 125mg, 2ml vial Ea No Bid No Bid $13.09 | NoBid No Bid No Bid
X P129 4.2gm/50ml Lifeshield Ea No Bid No Bid $26.51 | NoBid No Bid No Bid
X P137 10mg/ml (ampule or vial) Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P138 1ml vial or ampule Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P139 100ml IV bag Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P141 1ml vial (5mg/2ml) Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ODT 4mg disolvable tabs -
X P142 individual wrap Ea No Bid No Bid S.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P143 4mg/2ml vial Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P144 10 ml syringe luer lock Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P145 1000 ml IV bag Ea No Bid $3.46 NoBid | NoBid
X P146 250 ml IV bag Ea No Bid $3.33 $3.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P147 500 ml IV bag Ea No Bid $4.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P148 1000ml bottle Ea No Bid $3.45 No Bid No Bid
X P149 1000m| bag Ea $3.45 No Bid No Bid $3.53 $3.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P150 2 gram/500ml IV bag Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.25 $8.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid
X P151 500 mg/10 ML Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.90 No Bid No Bid
X P153 40 mg/20 ML Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.25 NoBid | NoBid
X P154 100 mg/10 ML Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.79 NoBid | $5.25 | No Bid No Bid
X P155 250 mcg/5ML Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid S4.17 No Bid $4.35 No Bid No Bid
X P161 10mg/ml 10ml vial Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.76 NoBid | $2.80 | No Bid No Bid
X P162 100mg/ml 10ml vial Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.89 No Bid S5.40 No Bid No Bid
X P163 2mg tabs Ea $3.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.50 No Bid No Bid
X P164 8 mg tabs Ea $5.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.60 No Bid No Bid
Nitroglycerin- 50mg/250mL, in
X P185 5% Dextrose - Glass Bottle Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




adult-Perfit Ambu Ace

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NoBid | NoBid [ISGARON No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NoBid | NoBid [NSI90MON No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

X T101 Adjustable Ea No Bid No Bid
X T102 Pediatric-Ambu Perfit Mini Ace Ea No Bid No Bid
X T103 Baby No Neck Ea No Bid No Bid
X T104 . Ea No Bid No Bid
X T104a Compairable to mega mover Ea No Bid No Bid
X T105 9' clip/snap buckle (3 pack) Ea No Bid No Bid
X T106 Adult - complete kit Ea No Bid No Bid
X T107 4' X 36' adult size roll or fold Ea No Bid No Bid $7.63
X T108 Adult Ea No Bid No Bid $520.03
X T109 Pediatric Ea No Bid No Bid $528.36
X T110 . Ea No Bid No Bid $132.20
X T112 Stryker Stair Chairs compatable Ea No Bid No Bid
X T113 Combi Il Scoop Ea No Bid No Bid
Straps for a Combi Il Scoop
X T113b Stretcher Ea No Bid No Bid
X T114 Stryker Stretchers Ea No Bid No Bid
X T115 Small Ea $65.28 No Bid No Bid
X T116 Medium Ea $65.28 No Bid No Bid
X T117 Large Ea $65.28 No Bid No Bid
EMS Case with Padded Bottom
Dividers, Adjustable Walls,
X T120 Multi Layer Lid Organizer Ea $342.19 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Statpack G3+ Breather Pack w/
X T121 Dividers Included - RED Ea $310.23 No Bid No Bid $316.95
Statpack G3+ Breather Pack w/
X T121C Dividers Included - Black Ea $310.23 No Bid No Bid
Statpack G3+ Breather Pack w/ -
X T121C Dividers Included - Green Ea $310.23 No Bid No Bid $316.95
Statpack G3+ Breather Pack w/
X T122 02 Module - Green Ea $378.03 No Bid No Bid
X T122C Stat Pack Divider Inserts Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid
X T123 . Ea No Bid No Bid
should hold tubes 5.5-9.0 &
X T124 Large handle and Blades Ea No Bid No Bid
fits standard DISS oxygen
X T126 outlets Ea No Bid No Bid
Statpack G3+ Breather Pack w/ -
X T127 Dividers Included - Blue Ea $310.23 No Bid No Bid
X T128 Multi-Grip - Adult Ea No Bid No Bid
X T129 Multi-Grip - Child Ea No Bid No Bid
X T130 Multi-Grip - Infant Ea No Bid No Bid
EMS Solutions Emergency Child
X T131 Restraint - SM-L Ea No Bid No Bid
X T135 Simple Thoracostomy Kit Ea $35.77 No Bid No Bid




Saphire Infusion pump-
X T136 Multitherapy- only Ea $210.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X T137 Suction Cups for LUCAS 3 Ea $50.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X T137B Neck Strap for LUCAS 3 Ea $90.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Butterfly - IQ 3 Ultrasound
X T150 device Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Butterfly - IQ 3 Ultrasound -
X T151 Charger Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Butterfly - IQ 3 Ultrasound -
X T152 Holster Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X T154 Canvas Jump Bag - Orange Ea  [NS272408 No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.13 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
Butterfly - IQ 3 Ultrasound -
X T153 cable- USBC Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X T201 Clear top 1040 - Yellow Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X T202 Clear top 1040 - Blue Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X T203 Clear top 1040 - Black Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X T204 Clear top 1060 - Blue Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X T205 Clear top 1060 - Red Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X T206 Clear top 1060 - Yellow Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Insert for Pelican 1550 EMS
X T207 case hook and loop drug insert Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X T208 Pelican Oxygen case 1550 Ea No Bid No Bid $334.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pelican 1550 Potector case w/
X T209 padded dividers - black Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X T210 Pelican Box Handle Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X T211 Pelican Box Latch w/pin Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
X T212 Stat Pack G3 Cell Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pelvic Binder - T-POD - SM -
X T223 Large Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TR0O403 series - SimBodies PRO
X TR1 Male Manikin Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Laerdal Advanced Airway
X TR2 Solution - LAE13503150 Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Humerus Intraosseous (10)
X TR3 Trainer - 101-205 Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gaumard S.M.A.S.H Advanced
X TR3 IV Training Arm -5402.100 Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TrueClot PCT3 Tourniquet Leg
X TR4 Trainer - 5172D Ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Laerdal Resusci Baby QCPR -
X TR5 Wireless 161-01260 Ea No Bid No Bid $1,475.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Premature Anne Task Trainer -
X TR6 290-00050 Ea $3,238.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total $58,075.57 | $191.9075 | $21,483.42 ($5,168.9252|$69,641.9061| $45,225.68 |$5,998.10| $404.3963 | $2,265.05 $86.00




Clay County
Purchasing Division

477 Houston Street, Green Cove Springs, FL 32043

Company:
Bound Tree Medical, LLC

Email:
submitbids@boundtree.com

Contact:
Christopher Fyffe

Address:
5000 Bradenton Ave
Dublin, OH 43017

Phone:
(800) 533-0523

Website:
www.boundtree.com

Submission Date:

[BOUND TREE MEDICAL, LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
RFB No. 25/26-087

EMS Medical Supplies
RESPONSE DEADLINE: June 1, 2026 at 4:00 pm

Bound Tree Medical, LLC Response

CONTACT INFORMATION

Jun 1, 2026 1:40 PM (Eastern Time)


http://www.boundtree.com/

Clay County
Purchasing Division

477 Houston Street, Green Cove Springs, FL 32043

[DRAKE PHARMACY SOLUTIONS LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
RFB No. 25/26-087
EMS Medical Supplies
RESPONSE DEADLINE: June 1, 2026 at 4:00 pm

Drake Pharmacy Solutions LLC Response

CONTACT INFORMATION

Company:
Drake Pharmacy Solutions LLC

Email:
dylan@drakepharmacysolutions.com

Contact:
Dylan Drake

Address:
675 Tamiami Trail Unit 12
Port Charlotte, FL 33953

Phone:
N/A

Website:
drakepharmacysolutions.com

Submission Date:
Jun 1, 2026 1:32 PM (Eastern Time)


http://drakepharmacysolutions.com/

Clay County
Purchasing Division

477 Houston Street, Green Cove Springs, FL 32043

[HAMILTON MEDICAL, INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
RFB No. 25/26-087

EMS Medical Supplies
RESPONSE DEADLINE: June 1, 2026 at 4:00 pm

Hamilton Medical, Inc Response

CONTACT INFORMATION

Company:
Hamilton Medical, Inc

Email:
insidesales@hamiltonmedical.com

Contact:
Heather Hoffman

Address:
201 Edison Way
Reno, NV 89502

Phone:
(800) 426-6331

Website:
www.hamilton-medical.com

Submission Date:
Jun 1, 2026 11:42 AM (Eastern Time)


http://www.hamilton-medical.com/

Clay County
Purchasing Division

477 Houston Street, Green Cove Springs, FL 32043

[HENRY SCHEIN INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
RFB No. 25/26-087

EMS Medical Supplies
RESPONSE DEADLINE: June 1, 2026 at 4:00 pm

Henry Schein Inc Response

CONTACT INFORMATION

Company:
Henry Schein Inc

Email:
emsbids@henryschein.com

Contact:
Julia Strange

Address:
135 Duryea Rd
Melville, NY 11747

Phone:
(631) 843-5500

Website:
www.henryschein.com

Submission Date:
May 29, 2026 11:34 AM (Eastern Time)


http://www.henryschein.com/

Clay County
Purchasing Division

477 Houston Street, Green Cove Springs, FL 32043

Company:
Life-Assist Inc

Email:
guotes@life-assist.com

Contact:
Contracts Department

Address:
11277 Sunrise Park Drive
Rancho Cordova, CA 95742

Phone:
(800) 824-6016

Website:
http://www.life-assist.com/

Submission Date:
Jun 1, 2026 1:39 PM (Eastern Time)

[LIFE-ASSIST INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
RFB No. 25/26-087

EMS Medical Supplies
RESPONSE DEADLINE: June 1, 2026 at 4:00 pm

Life-Assist Inc Response

CONTACT INFORMATION


http://www.life-assist.com/

Clay County
Purchasing Division

477 Houston Street, Green Cove Springs, FL 32043

[MCKESSON MEDICAL-SURGICAL GOVERNMENT SOLUTIONS LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
RFB No. 25/26-087

EMS Medical Supplies
RESPONSE DEADLINE: June 1, 2026 at 4:00 pm
Report Generated: Tuesday, June 16, 2026

McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC Response

CONTACT INFORMATION

Company:
McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC

Email:
government.bids@mckesson.com

Contact:
Proposal Manager

Address:
9954 Mayland Drive, Suite 5176
Henrico, VA 23233-1464

Phone:
(833) 343-2700

Website:
www.mckesson.com

Submission Date:
Jun 1, 2026 2:13 PM (Eastern Time)


http://www.mckesson.com/

Clay County
Purchasing Division

477 Houston Street, Green Cove Springs, FL 32043

[MEQU WARMER SYSTEMS CORPORATION] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
RFB No. 25/26-087

EMS Medical Supplies
RESPONSE DEADLINE: June 1, 2026 at 4:00 pm

MEQU Warmer Systems Corporation Response

CONTACT INFORMATION

Company:
MEQU Warmer Systems Corporation

Email:
ch@mequ-usa.com

Contact:
Carolyn Hollander

Address:

1501 Langston Blvd

Suite 301

Arlington, VA 22209-1109

Phone:
(208) 484-8282

Website:
WWW.Mmequ-usa.com

Submission Date:
Jun 1, 2026 1:51 PM (Eastern Time)


http://www.mequ-usa.com/

Clay County
Purchasing Division

477 Houston Street, Green Cove Springs, FL 32043

[REVELATION WHOLESALE LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Company:
Revelation Wholesale LLC

Email:
sowens@revelationwholesale.net

Contact:
Shelby Owens

Address:
497 State Rd 436 E Suite 115
Casselberry, FL 32707

Phone:
(321) 461-3184

Website:
www.revelationwholesale.net

Submission Date:
May 29, 2026 5:09 PM (Eastern Time)

RFB No. 25/26-087

EMS Medical Supplies
RESPONSE DEADLINE: June 1, 2026 at 4:00 pm

Revelation Wholesale LLC Response

CONTACT INFORMATION


http://www.revelationwholesale.net/

Clay County
Purchasing Division

477 Houston Street, Green Cove Springs, FL 32043

[STRYKER SALES, LLC THROUGH ITS MEDICAL DIVISION] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
RFB No. 25/26-087
EMS Medical Supplies
RESPONSE DEADLINE: June 1, 2026 at 4:00 pm

Stryker Sales, LLC through its Medical Division Response

CONTACT INFORMATION

Company:
Stryker Sales, LLC through its Medical Division

Email:
bidsinbox@stryker.com

Contact:
Stryker bidsinbox

Address:
11811 Willows Rd. NE
Portage, MI 495002

Phone:

(800) 442-1142
Website:
stryker.com

Submission Date:
Jun 1, 2026 11:26 AM (Eastern Time)


http://stryker.com/

Clay County
Purchasing Division

477 Houston Street, Green Cove Springs, FL 32043

Company:
Technicuff Corp.

Email:
caroline@technicuff.com

Contact:
Caroline Van Dyken

Address:
2525 Industrial St.
Leesburg, FL 34748

Phone:
N/A

Website:
www.technicuff.com

Submission Date:

Jun 1, 2026 11:52 AM (Eastern Time)

[TECHNICUFF CORP.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
RFB No. 25/26-087

EMS Medical Supplies
RESPONSE DEADLINE: June 1, 2026 at 4:00 pm

Technicuff Corp. Response

CONTACT INFORMATION


http://www.technicuff.com/

CONTACT INFORMATION

Company
Traffic Protection Solutions

Email
matt@trafficprotectionsolutions.com

Contact
Matthew Heck

Address

3061 Philips Highway Unit 104
Jacksonville, FL 32207

Phone
(904) 402-9468

Website
N/A

Submission Date
May 18, 2026 9:02 AM (Eastern Time)

Traffic Protection Solutions Response

Pricing unsealed at Jun 2, 2026 9:03 AM

@ No Bid

"No Bid" submitted on May 18, 2026 9:02 AM for the following reason:
We do not offer the products or services sought



Invitation For Bid #25/26-087
Title: EMS Medical Supplies

3. Scope of Work

3.1. Purpose

The Clay County Board of County Commissioners (County) is soliciting bids from qualified
Suppliers to furnish and deliver Emergency Medical Services (EMS) medical supplies on an as-
needed basis in accordance with the specifications, terms, and conditions set forth herein.

The intent of this Request for Bids (RFB) is to award to one (1) or more Suppliers capable of
providing high-quality, standardized EMS supplies that meet the County’s operational, clinical,
and compatibility requirements.

3.2. Scope of Services

A. General Requirements

1. The Supplier shall furnish, supply, and deliver EMS medical supplies on an as-needed
basis to the Clay County Fire Rescue Logistics Office located at 3249 Craftsman Road,
Green Cove Springs, Florida 32043.

2. All products shall be:
a. New, unused, and free from defects.
b. In original manufacturer packaging.
c. Compliant with all applicable federal, state, and local regulations.
d. Consistent with the specifications and requirements of this RFB.

3. No substitutions, deviations, or exceptions shall be permitted except as expressly
authorized in writing by the County.

B. Product Standardization Requirements
1. Specified Products

a. Where a manufacturer, brand, or specific product is identified, the Supplier shall
provide the exact specified item.

b. Suppliers shall not submit pricing for items they are unable to provide as

III

specified unless the item is expressly identified as allowing an “approved equa

2. Approved Equals - For items designated as allowing an “approved equal,” the
Supplier shall:

a. Clearly identify the proposed product.

21



Invitation For Bid #25/26-087
Title: EMS Medical Supplies

b. Provide manufacturer name and part number.
c. Provide supporting specifications upon request.

The County reserves the sole right to determine acceptability of any proposed
equivalent.

Compatibility Requirement

a. All products shall be fully compatible with existing County equipment, clinical
protocols, and operational practices.

C. Pricing Requirements and Unit of Measure

1.

5.

Required Pricing Format

a. Suppliers shall provide a Unit Price per individual unit (“each”) for all items.
b. The Unit Price (“each”) shall be the basis for evaluation and award.
Packaging Requirements - Suppliers shall also provide:

a. Packaging type (box, case, pack, etc.)

b. Units per package

Bulk Packaging Clarification - For items sold only in bulk quantities, the Unit Price
“each”) shall be derived from the total package price divided by the number of units
per package.

All-Inclusive Pricing - All pricing shall be inclusive of:
a. Shipping

b. Delivery

c. Fuel surcharges

d. Handling

e. Any other associated costs

No additional fees shall be permitted.

D. Ordering - No guarantee is made as to the quantity of goods to be purchased.

1.

2.

Orders shall be issued on an as-needed basis.

No minimum order quantities are guaranteed.

22



Invitation For Bid #25/26-087
Title: EMS Medical Supplies

3. Items may be ordered by all County departments.
E. Delivery Requirements
1. Standard Delivery

a. Delivery shall occur within seventy-two (72) hours of order placement for in-
stock items.

2. Non-Stock / Specialty Items

a. Delivery shall occur within manufacturer lead times.

b. Supplier shall notify the County at time of order placement.
3. Delivery Conditions

a. Deliveries shall be made to the Clay County Fire Rescue (CCFR) Logistics Office
located at 3249 Craftsman Road, Green Cove Springs, Florida 32043.

b. Bulk shipments shall be palletized.
c. Lift gate service shall be provided when required.
d. Supplieris responsible for ensuring products arrive in acceptable condition.
F. Backorders and Supply Availability
1. Supplier shall notify the County immediately upon identification of any backorder.

2. Backordered items shall be fulfilled within fourteen (14) calendar days, unless
otherwise approved by the County.

3. If the Supplier fails to meet this requirement, the County reserves the right to
procure from alternate sources.

G. Substitutions
1. Substitutions are strictly prohibited without prior written approval.
2. All substitution requests shall:
a. Meet or exceed original specifications
b. Include manufacturer name and part number.
3. Unauthorized substitutions may be rejected at Supplier expense.

4. Inthe event a specified product is discontinued, phased out, or otherwise
unavailable from the manufacturer, the County reserves the right to evaluate and



Invitation For Bid #25/26-087
Title: EMS Medical Supplies

approve an equivalent replacement product through its internal EMS review
process. Replacement products proposed by the manufacturer or Supplier shall not
be accepted without prior written approval from the County.

H. Shelf-Life Requirements

1. All products furnished by the awarded Suppliers shall meet the following shelf-life
requirements:

a. Minimum Shelf Life at Delivery.

i. All medications shall have a minimum remaining shelf life of twelve (12)
months.

b. Expiration Dating
i. Allitems shall be clearly marked with manufacturer expiration dates.
ii. Expiration dates shall be legible and not altered.

c. Short-Dated Product Restrictions

i. Products with less than required shelf life shall not be accepted without prior
written approval from the County.

d. Replacement Requirement

i. Any product delivered that does not meet shelf-life requirements shall be
replaced at no cost to the County.

e. Storage and Handling

i. Supplier shall ensure proper storage and handling to maintain product
integrity and shelf life.

Product Evaluation and Samples
1. The County may request product samples at no cost.
2. Products will be evaluated for:

a. Performance

b. Compatibility

c. Quality

24



Invitation For Bid #25/26-087
Title: EMS Medical Supplies

3. The County reserves the right to reject any product that does not meet

requirements.

J.  Additional Catalog Items

1. Suppliers may offer a percentage discount off published catalog pricing for items not
listed.
2. Catalog pricing shall be verifiable and subject to County approval.
3. Use of catalog items is at the sole discretion of the County.
4. Suppliers may be requested to provide electronic catalog access or current product
catalog information upon request.
3.3. Payment

The County reserves the right to reject any invoice that is incomplete, inaccurate, or not in
accordance with this RFB.

Payment may be withheld for any goods not delivered, not accepted, or not in compliance with
the specifications of this RFB.

A. All payments made to awarded Suppliers shall be in accordance with the Florida Local

Government Prompt Payment Act, Florida Statutes.

1.

The County shall remit payment for goods properly delivered and accepted within
forty-five (45) days of receipt of a proper invoice.

B. A proper invoice shall, at a minimum, include:

1.

2.

6.

Purchase Order number
Invoice date

Description of items delivered
Quantities and unit pricing
Delivery location

Confirmation of receipt and acceptance by an authorized County representative

3.4. Pricing Stability and Adjustments

A. All pricing shall remain firm for a minimum period of one (1) year from the date of

award by the Board of County Commissioners.

25



Invitation For Bid #25/26-087
Title: EMS Medical Supplies

B. Any request for price adjustment shall:
a. Be submitted in writing
b. Include documented manufacturer price increases or market justification
c. Be subject to review and approval by the County

C. The County reserves the right to:
a. Accept or reject any proposed price adjustment
b. Request additional supporting documentation
c. Procure items from alternate sources if deemed in the best interest of the County

D. The County reserves the right to procure products from alternate sources if awarded
pricing is determined to be unreasonable, non-competitive, or if the awarded Supplier is
unable to meet delivery, supply, or performance requirements.

E. No price increases shall be applied without prior written approval from the County.

3.5. Award

The County reserves the right to:
A. Award by item, category, or in total
B. Award to multiple Suppliers

C. Designate primary and secondary Suppliers to ensure continuity of supply and
operational reliability

The County further reserves the right to negotiate pricing with the lowest responsive and
responsible Bidder(s), provided that the Scope of Work of the RFB remains unchanged.

No guarantee is made as to the quantity of goods to be purchased.

3.6. Term

The initial term shall be two (2) years from the Effective Date of the Agreement, with the option
to renew for two (2) additional one (1) year periods, upon mutual written agreement of the
parties.

3.7. Performance Evaluation

A work performance evaluation will be conducted periodically to ensure compliance with the
award of the RFB.
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Invitation For Bid #25/26-087
Title: EMS Medical Supplies

3.8. Additional Services

If the County and/or awarded Supplier identifies any additional services to be provided by
Supplier that are not covered under the Agreement but are beneficial to the County, such
additional services shall be mutually negotiated between the County and the Supplier.
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